
CHECK OUT OUR LATEST 
ADDITIONS IN 
GLOVES, SAFETY WEAR, 
AND MORE!

This revolutionary glove is 
our first ANSI Cut Level A4 

glove available with an 
ultra-light, 18 gauge 

Tuffalene® HDPE shell. The 
high-visibility orange shell 
with orange foam nitrile 

dip ensures that this glove 
will be easy to see, no 

matter the environment. 

SAMURAI GLOVE®

ULTRA-LIGHT A4

Item

CR488
Sizes

6(XS)-11(2XL)

EXPECTED APRIL 10 2017



Item

CR788
Sizes

6(XS)-11(2XL)

Item

CR509
Sizes

7(S)-11(2XL)

Item

GLO-077
Sizes

MEDIUM-5XL

Item

GLO-15LED
Sizes

MEDIUM-5XL

Item

CR18NFT-R
Sizes

6(XS)-10(XL)

Another ANSI Cut Level A4 
glove available with an 

ultra-light shell, this salt & 
pepper version is great for 
hiding stains and dirt. The 
salt & pepper liner is made 
from 18 gauge Tuffalene® 

HDPE. The black foam 
nitrile palm dip ensures the 

user has consistent grip 
and is also touch-screen 

compatible. 
A reinforced thumb crotch 

increases the wear 
resistance of this 
exceptional glove. 

SAMURAI GLOVE®

ULTRA-LIGHT A4
Perfect for high-risk 

environments where Arc 
Flash rated gloves are 

necessary, this new glove 
combines an ANSI Arc 

Flash 2 rating with an ANSI 
Cut Level A4 rating.

A high-quality aramid liner 
combined with a neoprene 
bi-polymer palm dip, this 
flame resistant glove is a 

great choice.

GRIPSTER® FR
ARC FLASH 2 GLOVE

This feature rich ANSI 
Class 2 surveyor style vest 

can be seen from 
anywhere. 

Photoluminscent strips are 
sewn between silver 

reflective material and then 
placed between an orange 
contrast on a yellow/green 

lightweight mesh shell. 
In addition to the visibility 

features of this vest, it also 
includes 3 outside pockets, 
2 inside pockets and 1 iPad 
pocket with a Hook & Loop 
closure. It zips closed and 

has a D-ring opening in the 
back.

FROGWEAR® HV
GLOW-IN-THE-DARK VEST

This second vest in our 
LED lineup features white 

LED lights on the front and 
red LED lights on the back, 

with three different light 
pattern options.

The high-visibility 
yellow/green is highlighted 

by the silver reflective 
material on orange 

contrasting trim. It also 
includes 4 outside pockets, 

1 inside pocket, 1 inside 
iPad pocket and a D-ring 

opening in back.

FROGWEAR® HV
LED VEST

Combining a high-visibility 
yellow/green, 18 gauge 

Tuffalene® HDPE shell with 
a black nitrile dip, this 

striking new glove carries 
an ANSI Cut Level A2 

rating.
A New Foam Technology 
palm dip delivers a good 
grip to compliment the 
added wear value of a 

reinforced thumb crotch. 

SAMURAI GLOVE®

HIGH-VISIBILITY GLOVE

EXPECTED APRIL 10 2017 EXPECTED APRIL 15 2017 EXPECTED APRIL 30 2017 EXPECTED APRIL 30 2017 CURRENTLY AVAILABLE



Item

CR183NFT-RD
Sizes

7(S)-10(XL)

Item

GLO-SJ1
Sizes

MEDIUM-5XL

Item

GLO-V1
Sizes

MEDIUM-5XL

Item

508NFT-TS
Sizes

6(XS)-10(XL)

Item

TKHV19W
Sizes

19 INCH

Combining a high-visibility 
yellow/green Tuffalene® 

HDPE shell with a 
clean-looking black nitrile 
dip, this unique glove also 
carries an ANSI Cut Level 

A2 rating.
With a New Foam 

Technology 3/4 dip that 
delivers good grip, this 

glove also has the added 
wear value of a reinforced 
thumb crotch and dotted 

palm.

SAMURAI GLOVE®

HIGH-VISIBILITY 
DOTTED PALM The first of its kind in the 

FrogWear® lineup, this 
softshell jacket brings 

comfort to an ANSI Class 3 
jacket. Surprisingly warm 

and cozy, this is the perfect 
jacket for chilly spring or 

fall days.
This jacket features silver 

reflective material, 
adjustable sleeve cuffs and 
3 inside pockets as well as 
a black bottom and inner 

sleeves.

FROGWEAR® HV
SOFT-SHELL JACKET

Get double wear out of this 
vest with two different 

looks to choose from. The 
outer ANSI Class 2 

high-visibility yellow/green 
150D oxford fabric 

contrasts with the black 
bottom and silver reflective 
material. Reverse the vest 

for an all-black look.
This vest zips closed and 
features 2 inside and 2 

outside pockets.

FROGWEAR® HV
REVERSIBLE VEST

Forget about taking off 
your gloves to handle 
phones or other touch 

screen instruments. This 
green/black nylon shell 
glove has a black New 

Foam Technology palm dip 
that is touch screen 

compatible. It also features 
a reinforced thumb crotch 

that may increase the 
lifespan and wearability of 

this glove.

TSUNAMI GRIP®

TOUCH SCREEN

For those preferring the 
comfort of a loose fitting 

protective sleeve, this 
heavyweight, 19 inch long 
TuffKut™ sleeve offers a 

great solution to 
uncomfortable cut 

resistant sleeves. With 
worker-preferred, 

itch-free, comfortable fit 
vs. regular sleeve styles, it 
is also secure and custom 

fitting. A Hook & Loop 
closure in the forearm & 

wrist area allows for 
flexibility on exact sizing.

TUFFKUT®

HIGH-VISIBILITY 
ADJUSTABLE SLEEVE

CURRENTLY AVAILABLE EXPECTED APRIL 30 2017 EXPECTED APRIL 30 2017 EXPECTED APRIL 10 2017 CURRENTLY AVAILABLE



Item

PUG-14TS
Sizes

6(XS)-10(XL)

Item

905PF
Sizes

S-XL

Item

GLO-209
Sizes

MEDIUM-5XL

Item

TKHV18SLT
Sizes

18 INCH

Item

TKHV14SL
Sizes

14 INCH

A great glove with a 
great-looking green & 

black shell, this general 
purpose glove is also touch 

screen compatible in a 
black polyurethane palm 

dip.

PUG® GLOVE
TOUCH SCREEN

Coming in a fishscale  
pattern that increases grip 

when compared to flat 
nitrile, these 6 mil orange 

gloves are a notable 
addition to the 

Panther-Guard lineup. 
They also feature a 

rolled/beaded cuff for ease 
of donning and spill 

resistance plus are FDA 
compliant.

PANTHER-GUARD®

POWDER-FREE FISHSCALE

Made of material that 
draws moisture away from 

the skin, this 
high-performance polo is 
great for summer jobs. 
ANSI Class 3 rated, the 

reflective material on this 
polo is segmented to allow 
for additional breathability 

and comfort.

FROGWEAR® HV
HIGH-PERFORMANCE 
ANSI CLASS 3 POLO

A variation on general cut 
sleeves, this high-visibility 

yellow/green sleeve 
provides a safer, more 

easily seen option. With a 
thumb slot for a secure fit, 

this 18 inch version 
provides a snug, 

comfortable fit. It is rated 
for ANSI Cut Level A4.

TUFFKUT®

HIGH-VISIBILITY 
18 INCH SLEEVE

This 14 inch version of the 
TuffKut® cut resistant 

sleeves comes in  
high-visibility yellow/green 

It features an ANSI Cut 
Level A4 rating and a snug, 

comfortable fit.

TUFFKUT®

HIGH-VISIBILITY 
14 INCH SLEEVE

EXPECTED APRIL 10 2017 EXPECTED MARCH 13 2017 EXPECTED APRIL 30 2017 EXPECTED MAY 29 2017 EXPECTED MAY 29 2017


